
BID TABULATION
Prairie Seed

Bid #0118-107

January 30, 2018 at 3:00 pm

Line 

Item Common Name Scientific Name

PLS lbs 

per acre

Qty PLS 

Pounds 

Needed Price Extended Price Extended Price Extended Price Extended Price Extended Price Extended Price Extended

Big Bluestem Andropogon gerardii 0.1 8.6 $10.00 $86.00 $9.45 $81.27 no bid no bid $18.00 $154.80 $10.50 $90.30 $14.38 $123.67 $13.42 $115.41

Canada Wild Rye Elymus canadensis 0.6 51.6 $7.00 $361.20 $9.00 $464.40 no bid no bid $18.00 $928.80 $7.00 $361.20 $11.07 $571.21 $13.42 $692.47

Indiangrass Sorghastrum nutans 0.8 68.8 $12.00 $825.60 $9.45 $650.16 no bid no bid $17.00 $1,169.60 $11.50 $791.20 $17.26 $1,187.49 $13.42 $923.30

Little Bluestem Schizachyrium scoparium 1 86 $18.00 $1,548.00 $14.00 $1,204.00 no bid no bid $22.00 $1,892.00 $14.50 $1,247.00 $17.26 $1,484.36 $15.26 $1,312.36

Prairie Dropseed Sporobolus heterolepsis 0.1 8.6 $100.00 $860.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid $238.00 $2,046.80 $218.00 $1,874.80 $287.67 $2,473.96 $114.73 $986.68

Prairie June Grass Koeleria macrantha 0.1 8.6 $150.00 $1,290.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid $65.00 $559.00 $38.00 $326.80 $172.60 $1,484.36 $63.57 $546.70

Rough Dropseed Sporobolus asper 0.5 43 $15.00 $645.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid $28.00 $1,204.00 $14.50 $623.50 $28.77 $1,237.11 $23.00 $989.00

Sideoats Grama Bouteloua curtipendula 1.5 129 $9.00 $1,161.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid $18.00 $2,322.00 $8.00 $1,032.00 $14.38 $1,855.02 $11.47 $1,479.63

Anise Hyssop Agastache foeniculum 0.05 4.3 $300.00 $1,290.00 no bid no bid $156.81 $674.28 $300.00 $1,290.00 $224.00 $963.20 $287.67 $1,236.98 $184.21 $792.10

Black-eyed Susan Rudbeckia hirta 0.2 17.2 $25.00 $430.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid $40.00 $688.00 $20.00 $344.00 $43.15 $742.18 $19.79 $340.39

Blue Vervain Verbena hastata 0.06 5.2 $150.00 $780.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid $117.00 $608.40 $118.00 $613.60 $172.60 $897.52 $31.73 $165.00

Blue Wild Indigo Baptisia australis 0.04 3.4 $200.00 $680.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid $190.00 $646.00 $224.00 $761.60 $258.90 $880.26 $185.00 $629.00

Brown-eyed Susan Rudbeckia triloba 0.15 12.9 $100.00 $1,290.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $105.00 $1,354.50 $143.83 $1,855.41 $31.73 $409.32

Butterfly Milkweed Asclepias tuberosa 0.2 17.2 $200.00 $3,440.00 $155.00 $2,666.00 no bid no bid $264.00 $4,540.80 $165.00 $2,838.00 $287.67 $4,947.92 $185.00 $3,182.00

Canada Milk Vetch Astragalus canadensis 0.05 4.3 $50.00 $215.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $42.00 $180.60 $86.30 $371.09 $82.36 $354.15

Common Evening Primrose Oenothera biennis 0.03 2.6 $35.00 $91.00 $29.00 $75.40 no bid no bid no bid no bid $38.00 $98.80 $115.07 $299.18 $33.05 $85.93

Common Milkweed Asclepias syriaca 0.3 25.8 $200.00 $5,160.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid $117.00 $3,018.60 $138.00 $3,560.40 $230.13 $5,937.35 $197.10 $5,085.18

Compass Plant Silphium laciniatum 0.1 8.6 $450.00 $3,870.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid $85.00 $731.00 $418.00 $3,594.80 $575.32 $4,947.75 $117.26 $1,008.44

Foxglove Beardtongue Penstemon digitalis 0.02 1.7 $300.00 $510.00 $399.86 $679.76 no bid no bid no bid no bid $488.00 $829.60 $575.32 $978.04 $194.73 $331.04

Golden Alexanders Zizia aurea 0.15 12.9 $150.00 $1,935.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid $224.00 $2,889.60 $178.00 $2,296.20 $230.13 $2,968.68 $250.00 $3,225.00

Great St. John's Wort Hypericum pyramidatum 0.05 4.3 $150.00 $645.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid $260.00 $1,118.00 $118.00 $507.40 $172.60 $742.18 $47.37 $203.69

Hoary Vervain Verbena stricta 0.09 7.7 $250.00 $1,925.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $124.00 $954.80 $172.60 $1,329.02 $95.78 $737.51

Illinois Bundle Flower Desmanthus illinoensis 0.15 12.9 $15.00 $193.50 $14.00 $180.60 no bid no bid $22.00 $283.80 $14.00 $180.60 $23.01 $296.83 $18.42 $237.62

Ironweed Vernonia fasciculata 0.03 2.6 $300.00 $780.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $308.00 $800.80 $431.49 $1,121.87 no bid no bid

New England Aster Aster novae-angliae 0.07 6 $500.00 $3,000.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $719.16 $4,314.96 $454.73 $2,728.38

Ohio Spiderwort Tradescantia ohiensis 0.07 6 $300.00 $1,800.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid $450.00 $2,700.00 $308.00 $1,848.00 $575.32 $3,451.92 $225.05 $1,350.30

Ox-eye (Early) Sunflower Heliopsis helianthoides 0.15 12.9 $50.00 $645.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid $67.00 $864.30 $64.00 $825.60 $86.30 $1,113.27 $46.05 $594.05

Pale Purple Coneflower Echinacea pallida 0.2 17.2 $150.00 $2,580.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid $118.00 $2,029.60 $118.00 $2,029.60 $287.67 $4,947.92 $100.53 $1,729.12

Partridge Pea Chamaecrista fasciculata 0.6 51.6 $15.00 $774.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid $30.00 $1,548.00 $12.00 $619.20 $17.26 $890.62 $10.26 $529.42

Prairie Blazingstar Liatris pycnostachya 0.18 15.5 $300.00 $4,650.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid $342.00 $5,301.00 $235.00 $3,642.50 $431.69 $6,691.20 $342.10 $5,302.55

Purple Coneflower Echinacea purpurea 0.2 17.2 $150.00 $2,580.00 $32.00 $550.40 $31.85 $547.82 $32.00 $550.40 $28.00 $481.60 $43.15 $742.18 $36.84 $633.65

Purple Prairie Clover Dalea purpurea 0.15 12.9 $75.00 $967.50 $47.00 $606.30 no bid no bid $56.00 $722.40 $48.00 $619.20 $57.53 $742.14 $44.00 $567.60

Rattlesnake Master Eryngium yuccifolium 0.1 8.6 $450.00 $3,870.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid $196.00 $1,685.60 $244.00 $2,098.40 $345.20 $2,968.72 $214.74 $1,846.76

Rosin Weed Silphium integrifolium 0.15 12.9 $250.00 $3,225.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid $180.00 $2,322.00 $178.00 $2,296.20 $258.90 $3,339.81 $193.95 $2,501.96

Round-headed Bush Clover Lespedeza capitata 0.1 8.6 $100.00 $860.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid $156.00 $1,341.60 $119.00 $1,023.40 $201.37 $1,731.78 $107.89 $927.85

Showy Tick Trefoil Desmodium canadense 0.15 12.9 $100.00 $1,290.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid $116.00 $1,496.40 $88.00 $1,135.20 $201.37 $2,597.67 $42.95 $554.06

Sneezeweed Helenium autumnale 0.05 4.3 $300.00 $1,290.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $574.00 $2,468.20 $575.32 $2,473.88 $222.32 $955.98

Stiff Goldenrod Solidago rigida 0.06 5.2 $200.00 $1,040.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid $318.00 $1,653.60 $348.00 $1,809.60 $431.49 $2,243.75 $484.79 $2,520.91

Swamp Milkweed Asclepias incarnata 0.05 4.3 $250.00 $1,075.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid $217.00 $933.10 $178.00 $765.40 $431.49 $1,855.41 $258.16 $1,110.09

Tall Coreopsis Coreopsis tripteris 0.05 4.3 $250.00 $1,075.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid $307.00 $1,320.10 $278.00 $1,195.40 $431.49 $1,855.41 $419.11 $1,802.17

Western Yarrow Achillea millefolium 0.03 2.6 $100.00 $260.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $58.00 $150.80 $86.30 $224.38 $40.52 $105.35

White prairie clover Dalea candida 0.05 4.3 $150.00 $645.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $118.00 $507.40 $143.83 $618.47 $94.74 $407.38

Whorled Milkweed Asclepias verticillata 0.05 4.3 $800.00 $3,440.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid $780.00 $3,354.00 no bid no bid $1,150.66 $4,947.84 no bid no bid

Wild Bergamot Monarda fistulosa 0.09 7.7 $250.00 $1,925.00 $200.00 $1,540.00 no bid no bid $227.00 $1,747.90 $218.00 $1,678.60 $258.40 $1,989.68 $160.37 $1,234.85

Wild Quinine Parthenium integrifolium 0.05 4.3 $150.00 $645.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid $200.00 $860.00 $168.00 $722.40 $230.13 $989.56 $613.16 $2,636.59

Yellow Coneflower Ratibida pinnata 0.15 12.9 $200.00 $2,580.00 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $174.00 $2,244.60 $230.13 $2,968.68 $89.58 $1,155.58

Total Bid Amount for Cedar 

Rapids:

Total Awarded Amount: $8,789.20 $9,348.60 $14,727.99$7,556.20 $4,857.43

Hoksey Native Seeds

Lynnville, IA

No

$8,698.29 $55,026.49$54,387.00 $93,668.68

Tangiers LLC

Ingomar, PA

No

Shooting Star Native 

Seeds

Spring Grove, MN

No

SiteOne Landscape 

Supply

Cedar Rapids, IA

Yes

Allendan Seed 

Company

Winterset, IA

No

$70,227.80

Prairie Moon Nursery

Winona, MN

No

Port Exports

Yarmouth, ME

VENDORS

Vendor Location

Local Business Certificate on File (Yes/No) No

GRASSES

FORBS

City of Cedar Rapids

$1,222.10 $56,521.20

$674.28
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Warranty:

How long pricing is held for:

Estimated Delivery upon 

receipt of purchase order: 

If a local vendor: % Difference 

from low bid:

Signature Page

1 Do You Accept Credit Card for Payment?

2 Quick Pay Discount

3 Does Discount Apply to MasterCard?

No

N/A

N/A

N/A

N/A

No

12 months

30 calendar days

3 months

N/A

see bid

12 months

see bid

Yes

N/A

N/ANo

see bid

12 months

10 calendar days

Yes

N/A

N/A

see bid

see bid

Yes

No

no warranty

12 months

2-14 calendar days

Yes

N/A

N/A

No

N/A

1 week 10 calendar days

60 days

5 calendar days


